
Terms of Service Agreement
1. Introduction

Welcome to PinkPelicanOnTheGo.com! These Terms of Service (the "Agreement") govern your
use of our online clothing boutique and any services provided therein (collectively referred to as
the "Services"). By accessing or using our website, you agree to comply with and be bound by
this Agreement. Please read these terms carefully before using our Services.

2. Eligibility

By using our Services, you affirm that you are at least 18 years old or have reached the age of
majority in your jurisdiction. If you are accessing our website on behalf of a company or other
legal entity, you represent that you have the authority to bind such entity to this Agreement.

3. User Accounts

You may be required to create an account to access certain features of our website. You are
responsible for maintaining the confidentiality of your account credentials and for all activities
that occur under your account. You agree to provide accurate and complete information when
creating an account and to promptly update any information that may change.

4. Intellectual Property

All content included on our website, such as text, graphics, logos, images, and software, is the
property of PinkPelicanOnTheGo.com or its licensors and is protected by copyright, trademark,
and other intellectual property laws. You may not modify, reproduce, distribute, or sell any
content from our website without our prior written consent.

5. Product Descriptions

We strive to provide accurate and up-to-date information about our products, including
descriptions, pricing, and availability. However, we do not warrant that product descriptions or
other content on our website are accurate, complete, reliable, current, or error-free. If you
encounter any discrepancies or errors, please contact us promptly.

6. Orders and Payments

By placing an order through our website, you agree to pay the specified price for the products
you purchase, as well as any applicable taxes and shipping fees. Payment must be made using
one of the payment methods accepted on our website. We reserve the right to refuse or cancel
any orders, and to limit the quantity of products purchased by any person or entity.



7. Shipping and Returns

We aim to process and ship orders in a timely manner, but we cannot guarantee delivery by a
specific date. Shipping costs are at a flat rate and delivery times may vary depending on your
location. Please review our Shipping and Returns policy for more information about our shipping
practices and return procedures.

8. Limitation of Liability

In no event shall PinkPelicanOnTheGo.com or its affiliates be liable for any indirect, incidental,
special, consequential, or punitive damages, including without limitation, loss of profits, data,
use, goodwill, or other intangible losses, arising out of or in connection with your use of our
Services or any products purchased from us.

9. Governing Law and Dispute Resolution

This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the
jurisdiction in which PinkPelicanOnTheGo.com is located. Any dispute arising out of or relating
to this Agreement shall be resolved exclusively through arbitration conducted in accordance
with the rules of the relevant arbitration authority.

10. Changes to this Agreement

We reserve the right to modify or update this Agreement at any time without prior notice. Any
changes to this Agreement will be effective immediately upon posting on our website. It is your
responsibility to review this Agreement periodically for changes. Your continued use of our
Services after any such modifications constitutes acceptance of the revised terms.

11. Contact Us

If you have any questions or concerns about this Agreement or our Services, please contact our
customer service team.

By using our website, you acknowledge that you have read, understood, and agree to be bound
by this Agreement. Thank you for choosing PinkPelicanOnTheGo.com!


